
(Contrat't i\Ianagement Usc only) 

CONTRACT APPROVAL FORM 

CONTRACTOR INFORMATION 

Name: ,C"OuPY!cf:"'a"x---"(F_,i,re'-'R"e"'s"'c"ue..,_)L_ _______ _ 
r_ J 

Address: 6631 N. Executive Park Court Suite 210 Jacksonville Florida 32316 
City State Zip 

Contractor's Administrator Name: Richard Durant Title: Education and Government Sales Manager 

Tel#: 904-296-1600 Ext. 2413 Fax#: 904-296-7111 Email: richarddurant@copyfax.com 

CONTRACT INFORMATION f'-) 

t i V/')l.ti~;;J))._ ~)li:' f n(H{-h Ui'e";v<---" 

Contract Name: Lease Agreement for Ricoh MPC5502A Color Copier Contract Value:__,·$,_,·3,5"'2"'2':';":84:!,..----,----
·;;(;; l '2/l ?; :-_) 'l 

Brief Description: *Piggyback contract from University of South Florida. *Contract No. ITNN 9-13-G for 36month lease, 
maintenance and supply agreement for Ricoh MPC5502A Color Copier. Monthly lease of$293.57: maintenance and supply base 
monthly charge of$130.00 includes up to 20,000 black and white prints per month excess black and white prints at $.0065 per 
print. All color prints at $.055 per color print. Includes all toners and supplies except paper and staples. 

'f C; . T)-;·y~, f(_ , 

Contract Dates: From 12-14-12 to 12-13,1~ Status: __x_ New Renew Amend# W A/Task Order 

How Procured: __ Sole Source __ Single Source __ 1TB ___ RFP __ RFQ __ Coop_X __ Other Piggyback Contract 

If Processing au Amendment: 

Contract#: ----------~Increase Amount of Existing Contract: ___________ No Increase 

New Contract Dates: ________ to ______ _ TOTAL OR AMENDMENT AMOUNT: ______ _ 

APPROVALS PURSUANT TO NASSAU COUNTY PURCHASING POLICY, SECTION 6 

1. ~? R·:/tJ -/.? o1251s29-544ou 
'De])artl1111t Head Signature Date Funding Source/ Acct # 

2. "'~ Date 

3. 
( '!.. -1...{ .,.( v 

Date 

4. I 

Comments: --------------------------------------Nr-

Date 1 

RETURN ORIGINAL(S) TO CONTRACT MANAGEMENT FOR DISTRIBUTION AS FOLLOWS: 
Original: Clerk's Services; Contmctor (original or certified copy) 
Copy: Department 

Office of Management & Budget 
Contract Management 
Clerk Finance 

I ) 



VENDOR NAME I ADDRESS 

NASSAU COUNTY ao 1 ;J.- Ql.O 1 j 

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS 
PAGE:ITJ OF[[] 

P.O. Box 4000 e ,'c;oftt LrttPtVo..(•'<J•/1. 

f. (} , i$o x. 11/t.o I 
FERNANDINA BEACH, FLORIDA 32035-4000 

.: •' ;,;PS~/\8TMEJIIL''-F .. 

Ft <!.. ;2.. eS (.P G-

•• VENDOR NUMBER PURCMASE ORDER NUMBER . 

ITEM .... : .. ·.·. ' > . • DESCRIPTION .. ·. •-, ··,·:·_·, NO: 

/<.;-U> k M P L-.-'l:57J -;;J._/}- Color 

C.., n 'v r <, .. "'" er o.•:"' -r .. ;- -e 

f'Q\~ I .... lvJ~J >A.\ I.Y2 
P,,_/).,1' /'e.e },, , ·.,- .5Jl... :'.i?i'J 

<: ~- 1J/.-.--- / E''A '.c: ",.__, H u-.AI. -~ 
B,_:d a.::. ,.".' -r f /) J ~OCJ /Ju.<£. k , f 
f.IA,'T2_/.~ }..,,./..- J?;.,-

--rf...:s· /'..-:iln.•.s, ··r.~--1 '< {!.,,. 

-the:... P.:_;,'o) d f1 /2..-1'-/-1?....-
I 

I jJ L<"O,.r>-7 X IL-u.-J's 

j 2.. ""'"~ ,--1, <: ~ Jj "?. 4'7_2_ ,jJL/ \ 
' / 

3/P M<PA-rlt- lc: .. <: G. 

/),.. ·.~u-• '..-J of :i,,_,rL.. F/,u-/,La..... 

.r n1111 qr.,.J- G 

' 
t;;f~~ SEP 5 2012 

REQUISITION 

E.S ·-oCJ I 
·.· PURCftASE ORDER DATE .. 

j2.-j-;L. 

!VI,,._ -c r Go--v eS 
REQU/SfTION BY: 

. PURCHASE ORDER ;r()TAL{; : .. :t>JstbDt·ir'!'Ef!MlL ,:: 

41 .1.S""22.. &'~ 
QUAN- UNIT·. AMOUNT • •> .. ·_-·••·: iFlWpl\c69llifrN\f~eW~r/ 

,_, 
. . • 

TITY: . PRiCE. 

IJJ 3.su . &-I.J 0 I z. •n s-2..''1 - c;7.f~Jo I I 

/ 

A/ 
t\. / /) /' \ rz.._ 

J.Y /1 .• 'U' 
\ 

/.') "o~ 
(J1 ~9/ 

11 I ~r~~~ { 
v 

WHITE - Finance Copy D Subtotal 
YELLOW M Requlslt!oner's Copy D Total 



CCJPYFA 

Jacksonville<«+ 
6631 N Executive Park Court 
Suite 210 
Jacksonville, FL 32216 
Phone: 904.296.1600 
Fax: 904.296.7111 

JULY 10,2012 

PROPOSAL 
FOR 

NASSAU COUNTY 
FIRE & RESCUE 

RICOH MPC5502A COLOR COPIER 
PB3130 PAPER FEED UNIT 
SR3120 STAPLER/FINISHER 
BRIDGE UNIT BU3060 
PUNCH UNIT PU3000 
FAX OPTION TYPE 5502 

LEASE OPTIONS 

36 MONTHS@ $293.57 PER MONTH 

UNIVERSITY OF SOUTH FLORIDA #9-13-G 

MAINTENANCE AND SUPPLY AGREEMENT 

BASE MONTHLY COST OF $130.00 INCLUDES 20,000 
BLACK & WHITE PRINTS. EXCESS BLACK & WHITE 
PRINTS AT $.0065 PER PRINT. COLOR PRINTS AT 
$.055 PER COLOR PRINT. INCLUDES ALL PARTS, LABOR, 
SERVICE CALLS AND SUPPLIES EXCEPT PAPER AND 
STAPLES. 

RATE GUARANTEED FOR 36 MONTH TERM OF LEASE 

Gainesville «<+ 
3210 SW 40th Blvd, 
Su!teA·2 
Gainesville, Fl32608 
Phone: 352.336.1771 
Fax: 352.336.8151 

St. Augustine «<+ 
140 Gateway Circle 
Suite 1 
St. Johns, FL 32259 
Phone: 904.827.0178 
Fax: 904.208.5105 

Daytona Beach «<+ 
480 Fentress Blvd 
SulteL 
Daytona Beach, Fl32114 
Phone: 386.252.2292 
Fax: 386.252.0920 
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''/ 

'I.JSE; UNllVERSlTY OF 
SOUTH FWruDi\ 

e AWARDED BIDS . o 

INVITATION TO NEGOTIATE NUMBER: 9-13-G 

Award To: 

Bell Techlogix, Inc. 

Dell Marketing L.P. 

Konica Minolta Business 
Solutions U.S.A.,. Inc. ---- ~ 

CRicoh. hlericas Corpor-ation__) 

Xerox Co'rporation 

BID TITLE: Copiers, Printers and Multi-Functional 
Printers 

Lot: 

Lot I 

Lot I 

Lot .II 

Lots I & 

Lots I & II 

----···---·---···-·------------

'· 



fN PROPOSAL TABUlATION 
iN TITLE: Copiers, Printers and Multi-Functional Printers 

~NUMBER:~S-~13~-G~-----------------

IPENING DATE: May22. 2009 TIME 3:00P.M. 

WARDED DATE . 0c"V" J4, ~Qqq 
OSTING TIM~/DATE h j . 

FROM. (:.. f'n !. IO.J~ 01 

'Z.i!M I !o/Jfillfl~ UNTIL: 

PAGE: I OF t-j. PAGE(S) 

'FAILURE TO EILE: A PROTEST WITH!N TRE TIME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.5/ (3) r 

FLOB.:IDA S~S, OR~ TO l?..OST 'TEE BONO OR OTEER SECORI'n:' ~~ 
BY JAW Wl:TJ':IN ~EE · ~IM<J ALLOWED' FOR FILING A BOND .SEALL CONSTITU'XE A WAIVER 
OF EROCEEDINGS 1lNDEil. <':lll\:P,TER 120, FLORIDA s=s: ALL BIDS/PROPOSALS 
ACCEPTED 61:: THE STATE ARE .SOBJ'I"...cT TO THE ST,ATE·1 S TER..li:!S F.ND CONDITIONS F..ND ANY 
AND ALL ADDITIONA:i :OERMS J.\ND CONDITIONS SUBMITTED BY THE BIDDERS/PROPOSERS .ARE 
E.E,JECTED AND SHALL EAVE NO FORCE AND EFFECT. OFFERS FROM THE VENDORS LISTED 
REREIN ARE THE ONLY OFFERS RECEI·\TED TIMEL':l AS OF THE ABOVE OPENING DATE AND 
TU:IE. ALL OTHER OFFERS SUBMITTED IN RESPONSE TO THIS. SOLICITATION, IF .ANX, ARE 
HEREBY' REJECTED AS LATE. 

ANY PERSON. WEO PILES AN 
8RTAINING TOA SOLICITATION 

AT THE T!M.E 'OF FILING ·OF THE FORMAL PROTEST, POST WITH THE ONlVERSI'XY A 
B9NP PAYABLE TO THE ONIVERSITY OF SOtrrH E'LO!UDA IN AN AMOUNT EQUU TO: 10 . 
P~T ·OF TEE ESti~ED.VALUE PF THE. PROTESTORrs BID QR PROPOSAL: 10 ?ERCENT 
OF, THE ESTIMATED EXI'ENDITORE. DURING·' THE CONTFACT TJ;:RM: $10 1 000: OR WRICHEVER 
IS LESS. THE BOND SBJ>.:LL. BE CONDITIONED UPON TEE PAYMENT pr ALL COSTS WE.ICE MAY 
EE ADJO'DGED AGA:r.NST TF,lE CONTRACTOR FILING· TEE PROTEST ACTION. IN LIEU OF A 
BO~""D1 T.P.E UNIVERSITY MA"i ACCEPT A CAS:S:IERrs CHECK OR MONEY ORDER IN THE llMOONT 
OF THE BOND, li'A.l:LURE 'I!O FILE ~BE PROPER 
PROTEST r SHU.L :RESULT :rn A DENIAL OF ~ 

~.,.,...,.~,_.~-~~l~~.'l.<lo'w~ .,.., 

~ !rEE ~DiE. OE' li':r:LZNG THE FO'F.MA:t. 

DESCRIPTION/VENDORS 'bos, · &\\ <.· · >- ''DeJ\ :Jo;;~<ba;., · '!Go-.1 · 
~4-,q;l'lc:j Teeh()tilog'A i'v\etr~~~/\..0 ~ 0""'1~We."'s · Co."'"'e.~:A..::,CX'\ 

ITN COVER SIGNED NO 

ADDENDUM NO. 1 SIGNED 

~~ NC- C1iS) NO l @J~ \:@ NO I WSi'~l 
~ N~ .~~ NO ~ NO. ~m NO J"~YI NO. I 

NO 1~ 'f.E:S5 . N':) i aES'). NQ r-~ ·---:;;-~@f) - NCJ- i ~ ADDENDUM NO. 2 SIGNED 

EEO SIGNED @:')·· NO· Y:EV . NO CfiS:) . . NO J YESJ NO ~ NO 

, W9 SIGNED . (YE,.V. · NO. I~ .. NO YEj;i NO ~ NO ~~. NO 

MINORITY-VENDOR' ~ . . ~ :. I r-;;;;:""" v ,-- I 

ENTERPRISE RESPONSE (#44) .I .C@,V NO j' ~ NO j ~~ NO I, .ES NO 

,c·Y"£s'' 
' --. .. ..-

YES NO 

NO 
~""~ 

(_;(:E.S~ PROPOSAL CONTENT I ~· I NO !I~ I NO ~:::- ® I NO NO 

# PROPOS~~ COPIE$ \.oti~i'\il>l :;;;~~2-~ \¢'flit\~ lfetlQ1&s~l l.ic-;,5;!\a~ !,\~~~@.$ . I ;{ . 
.Dfiait.-:.r.. • .t ·7 eop~e:> 

< • ·l • 
t. a.~~~r•aJ /'f t:?.£JP r~~" 

NO BID ;YES I . ljO ll YES I NO ,If YES j NO YES I · NO YES NO 

DISQUALIFIED (REASON/S) 
~ OT l:. 1 !..()T-:;r:. 

---- --------

IPENED BY: Mark Lillguist TABULA TED BY: Lo '2.0. (<'b s~D."A¥_ VERIFIED BY: ""'-

'EMARKS: CIRCLED PRICE INDICATES INTENT TO AWARD. 
REV.8/712008 

--·-----.. -·-·------



N TITLE: Copiers. Prinfers and Multi.Funetional Printers. 

N NUMBER: 9·13·G 

PENING DATE: May 22. 2()09 TIME 3:00P.M. 

WARDED DATE -
OSTING TIME/DATE 

FROM: I 

UNTIL: f. ----

PAGE: ~ OF L} PAGE(S) 

DESC.~IPTION/~NDORS CQ..r,,">C:t" i&.:o: ~'~~ 
. So\ )b01 --·- i\j) t (\.,",. 

-ITN COVER S.IGNED ® NO 

ADDENDUM NO, 1 SIGNED (fib ,NO 

APDEN!:'UM NO. 2 SIGNED. YES CEQ:) 
" ' EEO SIGNED \_YES')· NO 

W9 SIGNED · '- YE~) NO 

MINORITY VENPOR (!§:s NO 
ENTERPRISE RESPONSE (#44) 

PROPOSAL CONTENT ~ NO 

* PROPOSAL COPIES J r LJ <:-.:o;::/• e. S. 
NO BID YES NO 

DISQUALIFIED (REASON/S) 

F!<ILURE TO FILE A ~ROTEST l!IITRI!! TRE TJ:MJ:: 'PSJ>'SCIO:~W 'lN >~CUUN 
:120~57 (3) , FLORJ:DA S'l!ATOTES.r OR E'.A:CLt.T.BZ. !:CO POST TEE BOND OR OTEE:R 
SECW\ITY REQU:tl?.ED BY UiW WJ:TBm THE T!ME ALLOWED FOR FILING A BOND 
Sl!l\LL CO!!STIW:r:E A WAIVER OF PROCE:EDINGS ti!!DER C!!l\l?TER 120, FLORIDA 
STATOTES. ALL BIDS/P,ROPOSALS ACCEPTED BY TBE STATE ARE SUBJECT TO THE 
STATE 1 S '.L'E:RMS AND CONDITIONS AND ANY AND ALI: ADDITIONAL TERMS AND 
CONDI'r.IONS SUBMITT)!:D BY THE BIDDERS/PROPOSERs ARE REJECTED AND SHALL EAVE 
NO FORCE AND EFFECT. OF.E'ERS FROM THE "VE.i."'IDORS 'LISTED HEREI·N ABE THE ONLY 
0~ P.ECEIVE'O TIMELY AS OF THE ABOVE <;>:PENING ~ATE AN"D TIME. ALL OTE.ER 
OFFERs SUBMI,-TED IN !\ESPO:NSE TO THIS SOLICITATION, IF ANY, ARE HEREBY' 
REJECTED AS LATE. 

NOTJ:CE:OF J3m/PROPOS1lLS PROTEST BONDING REQU:r:REMEN'I'- .:wY PERSON WBO FILES 
AN ACTION PROTESTING A bl3C:CSION OR INTENDED DECISION PERTAINING TO A 
SOLICITATION SHALL AT ~HE TIME OF FILING OF·TBE FOR¥~ PROTEST, POST 
t'll'ITH TRE UNIYERSI'l''t A BOND PAYAB~E TO THE UNIVERSITY Oli' SOUTH FL.OR.IDA IN 
AN AMOUNT EQUAL TO: 10 E!ERCENT OF THE ESTIMAT.ED VALOE OF THE 
PROTESTOR;' S BID OR PROP(,)S.AL: 10 PERCENT OF THE ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE 
OORING 'l'P.E. CONTRACT -ntro:-:1: ~10,000: OR 'WHJ:CF.E~R IS LE::?S- TRE I)OND SHALL 
BE CONDITIONED UFON THE PAYMENT OF ALL COSTS WHICH MAX BE ADJUDGED 
AGAINS~ THE CONTRACTOR FI~ING THE PROTES1 ACTION. IN LIEU OF A BOND, THE 
ON:CVERSI'l:Y :MAY ACCEP:T A CASHIE..'!:i. 1 S CHECK OR "MONEY ORDER I·N THE AMOUNT OF 
TRE BOND. 
PR01I!EST, 

' 

T>C. ,~n Gw, West- Coos+ >Wo R~·coh 
. \ 

! 
Cop;e-~ Graphics ., 

! 
@ NO [;. YES em .cy_@ NO ~ _NO I 

i .:;/ 'r 

@) .~· @§} NO !!::.... YES:>' NO 
~ 

NO NO· ·i 

_€8) NO YES @· '(YE'S) NO ! -~ NO I 
~ NO YES _.__(NO) @§) NO ,j~ NO ! 
@;.> NO ~~ .. NO ~- NO. j (J§/ NO i 

I 
®' NO YES @> -~- NO I~ NO 

~ NO criD NO @ · NO 'Ci!§> NO 

-I + 1-{ (.t:>pie.s. /-1- d.. CJ)pies t .!~ t./ (Op; e.s l1 I -J..Lf co-,Oie.S 
. , 

YES NO YES NO YES NO ! YES NO, 
' f..,(i'f'J .::r.::v;g:. 

M I 
- ~ 

'PENEP BY: Mark Lillquist 
·! - - I r 

TABULATED BY: 1-..-QZ.Qfa ~ill M .\e . VERIFIED BY: _..;...,.... 

!fMARKS; CIRCLED PRICE INDICATES INTENT TO AWARD. REV.817/2008 -

' 



N TITLE: Copiers. Printers and Multi-Functional Printers 

N NUMBER: ::;:9-;.,_,13-""G"-----------

PENING DATE: May22. 2009 TIME 3:00P.M. 

WARDED DATE·------.,-----­
DSTING T!ME/DATE 

FROM: / ____ _ 

UNTIL: '------,--

PAGE:_3 OF L~ PAGE(S) -

:fAILURE TO FILE ·A PROTEST Wil:TliiN TEE ~D.IE PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57 (.3) 1 

FLORIDA S~OTES, OR FAILURE TO POST TEE B00P OR OTHER SECURITY REQUIREID 
BY r,AW WJ:THIN .TEE TIME 11LL0WED FOR FILING A BOND SEOO.J:. CONSTITO~ A 
'WA.IVER OF J?ROcrim-INGS 'ONDER CHAJ?NR ~20 r FLOOIDA: STATOTES ~ A-LI. 
BI.DS/PROJ?OSALS ACCEPTED BY THE STATE ARE SUBJECT TO THE STATE 1 S TEID:IS- AND 
CONDITIONS AN,D AN2. AND ALL ADDITIONAL 'J:ERMS AND CONDITIONS SUBMITTED BY THE 
BI:PDERS/PROPOSERB ARE REJECTED AND SHALL EAVE NO FORCE AND EFFECT. OETERS 
FROM TEE VENDORS :LISTED .HEREIN ARE TBE ONLY. OFFE;RS RECEIVED TIMEL'! AS OF TEE 
ABOVE. OPEN:ING DATE AND TIME. ALL OTBER OFFERS SUBMITTED ·IN RESPONSE 'TO THIS 
SOLIC;tTA.TIO~( IF ANY1 ARE HEREBY .REJECTED AS LATE •. 

NOT:tCE OF BID/J?ROl?OSALS. l?:R.O'JXST BONDJ:NG REQUJ:REMEN~- ANY PERSON WHO FILES AN 
ACTION PROTESTING' :A DEC:ESION OR INTENDED DECISION PERTkiNING TO A 
SOLI~I'l'ATI0N SHALL· .AT THE TIME OF E'ILING OF THE FORMAL PROTEST, POST WI.TH 
r:JE 'ONJ:VERSITY A BOND PA'iABIIE TO TEE UNIVERSI'I'~ OF SOU'l'H FLORIDA IN AN 
AMOUNT EQUAL TO: 10 PERCENT OF .'l'HE ESTIMATED VALUE OF 'mE PROTESTOR'S BID. 
OR P~OPOSAL: 10· PERCENT OF TEE ESTIMATED EXPEh'DITURE· DuRING THE CONTRACT 
TERM: $10,000: .OR WRICH:£VER IS. T .• F.SS. THE BOND .SHlU.L BE CONDITIONED UPON TEE · 
PAYMENT OF AI.·L COSTS WHICH ~y BE AD~D AGAINST TBE COl\'ITRACTOR FILING. 
THE PROTEST ACTION. IN LIEU OF A BOND1 THE UNIVERSITY MAY ACCEPT Jlo. . 
l.o~.c..1.=· i:J" \.o.ll.l!>l.o.t\ V.t\ J."JUl'iJ::l.l U.t:I.IJ.t:.t'>. J.J.'IJ :r:li.l!i ..<~l.'lUVlli"J.. UJ:- ·o~:Ji.l!; .CUJ.U.I • .l!:.lti..U.IU= :I.V ;::·.u. 

TBE PROPER BOND M 'rBE !r:t:Miil OF FJ:LmG 'I!HE :FORMAL PROTEST, SRA!.L RESOL~ m 
~ DENUL.OF'THE PROTES!i:, --DESCRIPTION/V$N.DORS So~ Ko"';c.a:. . -n::e.n 2.e.lf'lo o~·~,£ 5\&.':ll~d 

$ ,:[)'1- N\1. "10\-\a.. . -;ue 9-cr\ · So\~;..J"\'")o~ TIU'.Xi{\"\o3j (n,;;~p 

ITN COVER SIGNED ·~ N.O @:>· NO ·~ NO ~ NO @) NO 

ADDENDUM NO. 1 SIGNED ~· NO ~s~ NO YES ® YES G9) (!'§ NO 

.ADDENDUM NO, 2 SIGliiED YES ® ·~.· NO YES ® YES Gt92_ ®' NO 

.. EEO SIGNED I<:® NO ~ NO ~ NO ~· NO ~ NO 

W9 SIGNE·D ~ . NO. C!!§) . NO (t]]i~ NO ~;£_) NO eYES) NO 
.. 

MINORITY VENDOR Gi~~, ~ NO ·.~ NO ' (§) NO NO I@> NO 
ENTERPRISE RESPONSE (i44) --~ 

PROPOSAL CONTENT <@§) NO @>.NO ~ NO YES NO 'Cici:'. NO 

# PROPOSAL COPIES . · l orig +- 14 .ecpi-2.$ · 1 -r-· 4 eopii?,.:::, l + I c..~'i 1 + 4 e.oP~' tS ! + q: eotxe..s. 
NO BID YES NO ·YES NO YES NO YES NO YES NO 

DISQUALIFIED (REASON/S) . 
.t..lfr . .u-

·. 
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I 1\VI..t 
L[ 

' '" . 
l[. ·I· PAGE(S} 

DESCRIPTION/VENDORS 'if:JO;Z 

~ 
. ' 

ITN COVER SIGNED NO . . . . . 
ADDENDUM NO. 1 SIGNED c~sJ .· NO 

ADDENDUM NO. 2 SIGN-ED (YES/ . NO 

EEO SIGNED ·l(f YES_) NO· 

W9 SIGNED · .. ~ NO 

-

' 
YES 

YES 
' 

YES 

·f YES 
r 
' YES 

I 

MINORITY.VENDOE. @) l . 
. NO . 'r. YES 

ENTERPRISE RESPONSE (*44) 

PROPOSAL CONTENT €' NO YES. 

# PROPOSAL COPIEs I :+- Lfepp,es 
NO BID YES NO· .. YES 

DISQUALIFIED (REASON/$) 
LoT~ ~~Jl- 1 

.. 

li'AILORE 'TO FILE A PROTEST WITI:tiN THE TIME E'RESCRIBEO IN SECTION 120.57 {3} 1 
FLOIUDA S~$ r. .OR PAIL ORE 'l'O POS'l: ~ BOND . OR OTBER SECUR..!'l!Y REQu::cBED .. 
EY LAW WITlliN TEE. TJ:ME: l\IiLOWED. FOR. FILnlG A EOND S!!l\LL CONSTI=E A 'Wl\.IVER 
OF PROCEEDJNGS tJNDER CHAPTER .120, FLOIUPA STATOTES. ALL BIDS/PROPOSALS ... 
ACCEPTED BY TilE STATE AID} SUBJ'EC'l' TO THE- STATE t S TERMS AND CONDITIONS AND ANY 
AND AIJ;. ADDITIONAL TERMS Al>l'D coNDITIONS SUBMITTED B':( THE BIDDERS/P.ROPOSERS ABE 
REJECTED AND SHALL R.r..VE NO FORCE AND EFFECT. .OFFERS FROM THE' VENDORS LISTED 
HE...'ttEIN AM. THE ,O:&I,.Y OFFERS RECEIVED TIMELY AS OF TEE ABOVE OPENING DATE AND 
T!MEf. ALL OTHER OFFERS SCBMITTED ,IN MSPONSE TO TBIS SO!riCI'J:IATION, IF ANYr ARE 
HEREBY REJ:E;CTED AS LBTE. 

ICE· OF BJD/FROPOSALS l?RO.':CES'l! BOND:r:NG REQ~~- ANY PERSON WHO FILES AN 
ION· PP.O'l'£STING A DBCIS.I-bN OR INTENDED DECISION PERTAINING TO A SOLICI-TATION. 

SHALL AT THE TIME OF· FILING OF THE FORMAL PROTEST, l?OS'l' ~TITR THE. UNIVERSITY A 
!lOND PAYABLE TO Tl!E qNiv_ERSin OF SOUTH .FLORIDA IN AN ~.MOUNT EQUAL TO: lO . 
BERCENT 0~ TEE ESTIMATED V~UE OF TEE PROTESTOR'S BID OR PRO~OSAL: 10 PERCENT 
OF THE ESTIMATED EXPBNDI~URE DOR!NG'TBE CONTRACT TEHM: $10 1 000: OR WHICHEVER 
IS LESS .• THE BOND SK?.,:LL BE CONDITIONED UE'ON THE PAYMENT OF 1\.LL COSTS. WHICH HA.Y 
BE ~JUDGED AGAINST THE CONTRACTOR FILING THE PROTEST AC~ION. IN LIEO OF A 
BO~TD~ THE UNIVERSITY MAY ACCEPT A CASHIER 1 S ~~CK OR MONEY ORDER IN T4E AMOUNT 
OF ':r3E. BOND. FA.n.'ORE TO. FILE TEE PROPER BO:t-."D 
PROTES~ c SHALL Ra:SU!o!i! IN A DEN:tAL OF THE PRO~EST·. 

NO YES NO YES .. NO ·.·YES NO 

NO YES. NO YES NO YES NO 

NO YES NO YES NO YES NO 

NO YES NO YES ... NO ! YES NO 

NO YES NO YES NO YES NO 
. 

NO YES NO ' YES NO YES NO 

N.O YES NO YES NO .YES NO 

NO YES NO · YES NO YES NO 
-
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